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By LANCE-MICHAEL CORREIA
Record-Eagle staff writer

TRAVERSE CITY — From
dancin’ in the Dome to down
in the dumps, all in less than a
calendar year.

For most of the seniors on
the Traverse City St. Francis
football team, their prep
careers began with an excit-
ing playoff run that culminat-
ed in a Division VII state
championship in Pontiac. Few
saw actual game action as
freshmen, but the experience
left a definite impression.

Considering the past
Gladiators’ gridiron exploits,
one of those freshman — Pat
Heintz, now a senior half-
back/defensive back — fig-
ured that playoff success
would be an annual rite. 

“It was great,” Heintz
recalled. “We got to practice
with the varsity and dress for
the games. And we definitely
learned a lot — just the inten-
sity, and what it takes to make
a (playoff) run.”

But such gluttonous achieve-
ment proved difficult, and the

Gladiators struggled to 5-4
records in both 2000 and 2001,
making the postseason field
each year on playoff points
rather than the compulsory
six wins.

And after losing a grip on
the Lake Michigan crown in
2000 after claiming or sharing
it in each previous campaign
since the league congealed in
1990, the team’s first postsea-
son contest that season
proved far worse than disas-
trous. Northwest Conference

champion Kingsley saddled
St. Francis with a 56-13 past-
ing that ranks as the Glads’
worst playoff setback in histo-
ry.

“That was certainly a bad
way to end the season to say
the least,” TCSF coach Larry
Sellers said. “But considering
the fact that we had ... a lot of
players back from that state
championship team, it was
especially disappointing. We
had tremendous leadership in
1999, but that wasn’t necessar-
ily the case in 2000.”

“At Kingsley, a lot of us were
sophomores, so there really
wasn’t too much we could do
to try and get back in the
game,” said Mike Schram, now
a senior lineman and, along
with Heintz, one of four co-
captains. “Looking at that
scoreboard — that was pretty
hard. We had just come off of
winning states.”

The 2001 season wasn’t much
better. Another 5-4 record, no
Lake Michigan title, and
another back-door playoff bid
resulted in a similar first-
round postseason thrashing —
this time a 37-0 shellacking at

the hands of Glen Lake. It was
the first time in six years that
a Gladiators team had been
blanked, and the first time
ever that St. Francis had been
bounced in the first round of
the playoffs in two consecu-
tive seasons.
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Above, Glads coach Larry
Sellers instructs senior QB
Adam Clark.  At right, TCSF
senior back Mac Schilling
breaks off yardage in the
league title-clinching win
over Boyne City.

‘Glad’ to be back 
TC St. Francis eager to make up for past blowouts

WHO: Mio (8-1) vs. 
Traverse City St. Francis (8-1)

WHERE: Thirlby Field
WHEN: Saturday, 7:30 p.m.
RADIO: WLDR FM-101.9
UP NEXT: Winner of

Johannesburg-Lewiston/Coleman
——

St. Francis results
TCSF 28, Benzie Central 6
TCSF 32, Glen Lake 25
TCSF 40, Kalkaska 0
TCSF 68, Elk Rapids 0
TCSF 48 Charlevoix 0
Muskegon CC 46, TCSF 14
TCSF 27, East Jordan 6
TCSF 69, Harbor Springs 6
TCSF 23, Boyne City 20
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